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The aim of this project (investment student in environmental development and 
coordination of beauty in the scope of the Faculty of Agriculture at Mochtohor) to 
make a quantum leap in the systems involved students in the Faculty of Agriculture, 
University of Banha and transferred to the systems live up to global level in terms of 
employment potential student of human-in-cheek community and environmental 
development, including commensurate with the labor market needs and 
requirements of self-employment and international standards of quality and total 
quality requirements and had to be to contribute to students of the College of 
Agriculture at Mochtohor in relay undergraduate and graduate studies as well as 
faculty members and administrators and staff college to participate in this topic 
Festive Deals by contributing to building a culture of environmental inside and 
outside the college of awareness of the importance of environmental conservation 
and development of environmental awareness among members of the academic 
community and the public, and implementing effective ideas that protect the 
environment and natural resources that make the pursuit and preservation in a 
matter of urgency: (1.)The proposal to establish a digital system code for all 
buildings and facilities and laboratories within the Faculty of Agriculture at 
Mochtohor.(2.) The work of raising the surveyors of all buildings and facilities the 
faculty.(3). Co-ordination and beautification of the campus inside and outside the 
Faculty.( 4.) Raise environmental awareness among students about the risks that 
threaten the Faculty. (5.) To provide an opportunity for students and college 
students to discover and employ their energies and skills for their own benefit the 
physical and moral at the same time, which can total investment of these energies in 
achieving the strategic objectives of the University of Banha, Faculty of Agriculture 
at Mochtohor. (6.) Raising the field of buildings and facilities within the walls of the 
Faculty and accessories.  
Documenting and mapping explanatory comment on the postponement of the Faculty and 

the other for the realization of the detailed maintenance and repair- Inventory of buildings 

and facilities - Action code of digital quality depending on the nature of the buildings and 

their contents and internal floors and rooms - published codes by email and paper 

publications and signboards outside and within buildings - Coordination and beautification 

and maintenance of green spaces within the campus - Paint the walls and sidewalks within 

the Faculty- Participation and references tests of Industrial Security and Civil Defense inside 

the buildings every 4 months & Beauty College outer wall - about 20 training course and 

workshop covering the following topics: (a coding Building Digital - environmental 

awareness and beauty in society - waste recycling and agricultural biosecurity and 

environmental - the basis of internal coordination of the buildings - the foundations of 

coordination outside of buildings and safety - biogas and bio-fertilizer - industrial safety and 

civil defense - methods of student participation in environmental education - methods of  

planning and environmental development in the community). 

 


